

# CITY OF BRECKSVILLE BID TABULATION

Disposal of Rubbish, Recycle, Leaves & Street Sweepings/Vactor Debris

March 4, 2020 2:00 p.m.

**Present were:** City of Brecksville: Becki Riser, Director of Purchasing, Serena DeVito, Purchasing Clerk, Ron Weidig, Service Director, Matt Thomas, Service Foreman

Vendor Representatives: Rich Chandler, Rumpke, Dave Justus, Kimble Transfer & Recycling & Steve Vulic, Waste Management

<b>Bidder:</b>	<b>Rumpke of Northern OH</b>	<b>Kimble Transfer</b>	<b>Waste Management</b>	<b>Kurtz Bros.</b>	<b>Buyansky Bros.</b>
----------------	------------------------------	------------------------	-------------------------	--------------------	-----------------------

## CHARGES RUBBISH DISPOSAL

### ONE-YEAR CONTRACT

Per Cubic Yard	\$18.00	\$19.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Per Ton	\$42.00	\$41.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

### TWO-YEAR CONTRACT

<i>Year 1</i> Per Cubic Yard	\$18.00	\$19.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Per Ton	\$42.00	\$41.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<i>Year 2</i> Per Cubic Yard	\$18.45	\$20.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Per Ton	\$43.05	\$43.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

### THREE-YEAR CONTRACT

<i>Year 1</i> Per Cubic Yard	\$18.00	\$19.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Per Ton	\$42.00	\$41.75	\$42.00	No Bid	No Bid
<i>Year 2</i> Per Cubic Yard	\$18.45	\$20.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Per Ton	\$43.05	\$43.00	\$44.02	No Bid	No Bid
<i>Year 3</i> Per Cubic Yard	\$18.91	\$20.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Per Ton	\$44.13	\$44.29	\$46.12	No Bid	No Bid

### CURRENT FEES:

State of OH (4.75), Cuy. Co. Generation Fee (1.50), Community Host Fee(.60) <b>(current total \$6.85/ton)</b>	Cuy Co SWD (1.50), Dover Twn (.25), Ohio EPA (4.75), Twinsburg Twn (.35), Stark- (2.00) <b>(current total \$8.85/ton)</b>	OEPA (4.75), Co. Gen. Fee (1.50) Out of Dist (2.00) Host Fee (.25) <b>(current total \$8.50/ton)</b>
--	--	---

<b>Bidder:</b>	<b>Rumpke of Northern OH</b>	<b>Kimble Transfer</b>	<b>Waste Management</b>	<b>Kurtz Bros.</b>	<b>Buyansky Bros.</b>
<b><u>CHARGES FOR LEAF DISPOSAL</u></b>					
Year 1	\$12.00/yd	\$7.95.yd	No Bid	\$5.00/yard	\$3.00/yard
Year 2	\$12.00/yd	\$8.19/yd	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 3	\$12.00/yd	\$8.43/yd	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b><u>CHARGES FOR RECYCLE DISPOSAL</u></b>					
Year 1	\$95.00/ton	\$47.00/ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 2	\$97.38/ton	\$48.41/ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 3	\$99.82/ton	\$49.86/ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b><u>REIMBURSEMENT FOR RECYCLE DISPOSAL</u></b>					
Year 1	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 2	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 3	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b><u>CHARGES FOR STREET SWEEPINGS/VACTOR DEBRIS DISPOSAL</u></b>					
Year 1	\$44.00/ton*	\$41.75/ton*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 2	\$45.10/ton*	\$43.00/ton*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Year 3	\$46.23/ton*	\$44.29/ton*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	*Plus \$6.85/ton Disposal Fees	*Plus \$8.85/ton Disposal Fees			
<b><u>NAME/LOCATION OF FACILITY</u></b>					
	Broadview Heights Transfer Station 9191 Postal Drive Broadview Heights, OH (440) 746-0805	Kimble Transfer & Recycling 8500 Chamberlin Rd. Twinsburg, OH	Oakwood Transfer Station 7450 Oak Leaf Oval Oakwood, OH	Kurtz Bros 5603 Canal Rd. Valley View, OH	Buyansky Bros 9400 Broadview Rd. Broadview Hts, OH
<b><u>DISTANCE OF FACILITY</u></b> (from Brecksville City Limits)					
	-0-miles	18 miles	22 miles	17.5 miles	1 mile

## **EXCEPTIONS**

### **Rumpke of Northern Ohio**

None.

### **Kimble Transfer & Recycling**

If there is any increase or decrease in taxes or government fees during the term of this contract, it is Kimble Transfer and Recycling's intention that the increase or decrease will be passed on to the City on a dollar for dollar basis, and that compensation for any increase in fees will not be unreasonably withheld by the City.

### **Waste Management**

(See attached.)

### **Kurtz Bros.**

We will accept leaves; if road to dump area is too wet, we would refuse loads (on a hill). Call 216-986-7031 before sending trucks to verify.

### **Buyansky Bros.**

Dump site is not a registered EPA site. Leaves used as soil amendment in soil production, not composted. Leaves used as amendment in natural mulch production, not composted.

# WASTE MANAGEMENT

## Exceptions to Bid Specifications City of Brecksville

### Change in Law

All proposed costs and services set forth in this agreement are subject to adjustment in the event of any future governmentally imposed new regulations, increased taxes, fees, surcharges or assessment imposed on the service being provided under this agreement, including the disposal of solid waste.

Waste Management shall have the right to pass through its increased costs due to new or increased governmentally imposed tax, fee, surcharge or assessment, provided that it reasonably documents the amount of any increase and provides notice of any such increase prior to such increase taking effect.

2.

### FORCE MAJEURE

Waste Management's performance of the Service may be suspended and its obligations hereunder excused during the pendency of a cause or causes beyond its reasonable control, such as by way of example and not limitation: acts of war, public enemy, civil disturbance, riot or disorder; epidemic or pandemic; acts of God such as landslide, lightning, earthquake, fire, storm, the impending approach of a storm, or flood; explosion; restraining orders, interference by civil or military authorities, strike, statute, ordinance, government order or ruling; or other similar causes. In the event of an occurrence of a *force majeure* event, Waste Management shall notify the City immediately, in writing, describing the particulars of the circumstances preventing performance of the Service and its expected duration. Notice shall be provided after the effect of such occurrence has ceased.

3.

There is a four-ton minimum charge

See next page

4. Waste Management of Ohio, Inc. will only bid on acceptable solid waste. Title to all unacceptable solid waste will remain with the City and the City bears full responsibility and costs up to and including fines and penalties for any unacceptable waste delivered to Waste Management of Ohio, Inc.

Acceptable Waste – shall mean all non-hazardous solid waste generated by households in the ordinary course including food wastes and discarded papers, cardboard, plastics, cloth, glass and metal materials, but excluding Unacceptable Waste as defined herein.

Unacceptable Waste – shall mean, without limitation, any regulated quantity of a Hazardous Waste or Hazardous Substance as defined by federal, state or local laws or regulations; containerized wastes, the contents of which are not able to be identified; sludges; waste from a pollution control process or cleanup of a spill of a chemical substance or commercial product; waste tires; biohazards or regulated medical waste; friable asbestos; construction and demolition waste; soil, sod, tree branches and stumps; paint; motor oil; excessive storm debris or debris resulting from weather events such as hurricanes or tropical storms; Title to and liability for Unacceptable Waste shall remain with the City at all times.